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TERMS OF USE – BI Dry 3.0 
(Last updated: 13 Dec, 2024) 

 

INTRODUCTION 

These Terms of Use (the “Terms”) apply to your use of the software developed for 
simulating drying of concrete structures, called BI Dry 3.0 (the “Software”). The Software 
simulates the drying process under different conditions. More information about the Software 
is available at www.betong.heidelbergmaterials.se. 

The Terms constitute a binding contract between you, duly acting on behalf of a corporation 
or other legal entity (the “User”, “you” or “your”), and Heidelberg Materials Northern 
Europe Aktiebolag (“HMNE”, “we” or “us”). The Software is solely intended for 
commercial or other professional use, to the exclusion of any private use. 

HMNE grants you the right to use the Software pursuant to these Terms. Please read the 
Terms carefully before using the Software. You accept these Terms by clicking “Accept 
Terms of Use” in the Software or otherwise using the Software. If you for any reason do not 
accept parts of these Terms do not proceed by clicking “Accept Terms of Use” and do not 
attempt to access the Software. 

We reserve the right to alter the content of these Terms, at any time, without prior notice, by 
publishing an updated version of the Terms on www.betong.heidelbergmaterials.se/sv/bidry, 
by updating the Software to incorporate the new Terms or by otherwise providing the new 
Terms to you as appropriate. By using the Software or by continuing to use the Software after 
an update to these Terms, you acknowledge your full understanding of and accept the updated 
Terms. 

The Terms apply until you have destroyed or deleted the Software and all backup copies of 
the Software and all other materials related to the Software. However, your right to use the 
Software ceases with immediate effect if you violate these Terms. 

LICENSE 

By accepting these Terms in accordance with the above, HMNE grants you a non-exclusive, 
non-transferable, personal, limited, revocable license to use the Software on the terms and 
conditions set out in these Terms (the “License”). 

The License includes the right to download and install the Software on any compatible device 
or, where applicable, access the Software through a web link, and solely for the purpose of 
prediction, post-calculation and follow-up of the heat and strength development of concrete 
during hardening. Any other use is not permitted. 

The License is limited in time and may include a beta-version (for testing purposes) of the 
Software. 

 

 

http://www.betong.heidelbergmaterials.se/
http://www.betong.heidelbergmaterials.se/sv/bidry
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USE OF THE SOFTWARE 

In addition to any other user restrictions as provided for in these Terms and except as 
expressly permitted in these Terms, you may not: 

(a) violate the intellectual property rights or other rights of HMNE or its licensors; 

(b) copy, reproduce, republish, reuse, upload, post, transmit or in any other way assign or 
make available all or any part of the Software or its constituent components; 

(c) rent, lease, sub-license, loan, distribute or sell/re-sell or exploit the Software 
(including source code); 

(d) incorporate the Software with any other programs; and 

(e) make alterations to, or modifications of, the whole or any part of the Software. 

SOFTWARE AVAILABILITY 

The User is aware that the Software may be in beta testing phase and under development. 

In order to evaluate, improve and further develop the Software, HMNE may ask the User to 
participate in voluntary surveys and interviews. 

HMNE reserves the right to, at any time, modify, update and/or upgrade, temporarily or 
permanently, the Software (or any part thereof). The Software automatically checks for 
updates when started and notifies if a newer version is available for download. The check for 
updates function can be disabled in the Preference settings. 

You agree that HMNE may suspend your access to the Software if HMNE, in its own 
discretion, believes that your use of the Software is causing immediate and/or ongoing harm 
to HMNE or others. Consequently, you agree that HMNE will not be liable to you or any 
third party for any suspension of access to the Software under such circumstances as 
described in the foregoing. 

THIRD PARTIES 

We do not have any control and assume no responsibility for the content of any third party 
website or application which may be linked to in the Software. Such linked websites and 
applications, if any, are provided “as-is” for convenience only without any express or implied 
warranty as to the information provided therein. The terms of use of those third party 
websites and applications apply to your use of such third party websites and applications.  

INTELLECTUAL PROPERTY RIGHTS 

The Software and any third-party software, documentation, interfaces, content, fonts and all 
data accompanying this license whether in read only memory, on any other medium or in any 
other form are licensed, not sold or transferred, to you by HMNE for use in accordance with 
these Terms. 

All intellectual property rights (to be interpreted as broadly as legally permitted) existing in 
the Software shall remain the property of HMNE and its licensors. Furthermore, any 
trademarks and logos used in connection with the Software are the trademarks and logos of 
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HMNE and its licensors. Nothing in these Terms constitutes a transfer, assignment or grant of 
any ownership rights in any intellectual property rights from HMNE or any third party to you.  

Use of information generated by the Software for any unauthorized purpose without the prior 
written consent of HMNE is expressly prohibited. 

WARRANTY 

Use of the Software in the User's own operations is at the User's own risk. The Software is 
provided on an as-is basis and as-available basis. HMNE does not represent nor warrant that 
the User’s use of the Software will be secure, timely, uninterrupted or error-free, or that the 
Software will meet the User’s requirements or that all errors in the Software will be corrected 
or that the Software will be free of viruses or other harmful components or that the Software 
will operate in combination with other hardware, software, systems or data not provided by 
HMNE or that the operation of the Software will at all times be secure or that HMNE will at 
all times be able to prevent third parties from accessing or destroying data or the User’s 
confidential information. The warranty stated above is the sole and exclusive warranty 
offered by HMNE. There are no other warranties or conditions, express or implied, including 
without limitation, those of merchantability or fitness for a particular purpose. The User 
assumes all responsibility for determining whether the Software or the information generated 
thereby is accurate or sufficient for the User’s purpose. 

LIMITATION OF LIABILITY  

HMNE shall in no event be liable for any damages or losses, including, without limitation, 
direct, indirect, special, incidental, consequential or punitive damages, arising out of, based 
upon or resulting from these Terms or the User’s use of the Software, even if HMNE has been 
advised of the possibility of such damages. These limitations and exclusions apply regardless 
of whether the damages arise from breach of contract, breach of warranty, negligence or any 
other cause, provided that such exclusions and limitations are not prohibited by Swedish law. 

TERMINATION  

HMNE may terminate the Terms with immediate effect and at any time without prior notice, 
without incurring any liability whatsoever. The User may terminate these Terms at any time 
and the termination will be effective at the end of the current subscription period, if any. 
Upon termination, you will not have access to the Software. 

The Terms apply until the User has destroyed or deleted the Software and all backup copies 
of this and other materials related to the Software. However, the right to use the Software 
ceases with immediate effect if the User violates these Terms. 

COMSOL MULTIPHYSICS® AND DATA FROM SMHI AND YR 

The Software uses COMSOL Multiphysics® as a platform. When installing the Software, 
COMSOL Runtime™ is installed on the User's hardware. 

HMNE does not reserve any rights regarding COMSOL Runtime™ and/or does not make any 
warranties or is in any way responsible for the function or consequences of using COMSOL 
Runtime™. The terms of use for COMSOL Runtime™ are accepted upon installation and can 
be found at www.comsol.com. 
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The Software uses open data with weather statistics and forecasts from SMHI and YR. 

Data from SMHI is collected, processed and distributed in accordance with the license terms 
Creative Commons Attribution 4.0 International Public License. 

Data from YR is based on data from MET Norway (The Norwegian Meteorological Institute) 
and is collected and processed and distributed in accordance with the Norwegian license for 
public data (NLOD) Creative Commons Attribution 4.0 International Public License. 

MISCELLANEOUS 

HMNE has the right to engage third parties to perform any part of its obligations under these 
Terms. 

In the event any provision of the Terms is wholly or partly invalid, the validity of the Terms 
as a whole shall not be affected and the remaining provisions of the Terms shall remain valid. 
To the extent that such invalidity materially affects a party’s benefit from, or performance 
under, these Terms, it shall be reasonably amended. 

The User may not, wholly or partly, assign, pledge or otherwise dispose of its rights and/or 
obligations under these Terms without HMNE’s prior written consent. 

The Terms apply to use of the Software and do not change or alter any other contract or 
agreement between you and HMNE. 

These Terms are also available in a Swedish version. In the event of a dispute between 
Swedish and English version, the Swedish version of these Terms shall prevail.  

GOVERNING LAW AND DISPUTE RESOLUTION 

These Terms shall be governed by the laws of Sweden. 

Any dispute, controversy or claim arising out of or in connection with these Terms, or the 
breach, termination or invalidity thereof, shall be finally settled by arbitration in accordance 
with the Rules for Expedited Arbitrations of the Arbitration Institute of the Stockholm 
Chamber of Commerce. The seat of arbitration shall be Stockholm. The language to be used 
in the arbitral proceedings shall be Swedish. 

Each party undertakes to ensure that all arbitral proceedings conducted in accordance with 
these Terms shall be kept strictly confidential. This undertaking shall cover, inter alia, that 
arbitral proceedings have been initiated, all information disclosed during the course of such 
proceedings, as well as any decision or award made or declared by the arbitral tribunal. This 
Clause shall not restrict or prevent disclosure by a party of any information if and to the 
extent (i) the disclosure is required by law or applicable stock exchange regulations, or (ii) 
such disclosure has been approved by the other party in advance in writing. 

CONTACT  

If you have any questions or concerns regarding the Software, you may contact us by using 
the contact information below: 

Heidelberg Materials Northern Europe Aktiebolag info.betong.swe@heidelbergmaterials.com 

mailto:info.betong.swe@heidelbergmaterials.com
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